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There had been two demons in Modigliani’s life. One was a fever and one was a woman.

The Demon Room tells the story of the debauched and troubled artist Amedeo Modigliani through the eyes
of Leo, his art dealer, friend, and rival. Consumed by the thought of his own demise, Modigliani throttles
through life–and women–hoping to escape the demons that plague him. But when he stumbles into the arms
of Jeanne, a young and struggling artist, his salvation might also be his undoing,

From the absinthe-soaked streets of 1920s Paris to the salons of the rich and famous, with an astounding
voice, The Demon Room depicts a world where obsession, lust, and art go hand in hand, and where your
downfall might also be your lasting achievement. Fiction writer J.E. Reich's lyrical, moving, and riveting
debut is sure to grip you long after the last turn of the page.

About the Author:
J.E. Reich hails from Pittsburgh and received her MA in English Literature from Brooklyn College. Her
writing has appeared in Armchair/Shotgun, Everyday Genius, Volume 1 Brooklyn, gigantic sequins, Plain
China: The Best of Undergraduate Writing 2010, and other publications. She was nominated for a Pushcart
Prize in 2010 and in 2012. A Brooklyn resident, she is a contributor at Thought Catalog and is working on
her first novel.

Praise for The Demon Room:
"In The Demon Room, J.E. Reich has constructed an opulent narrative, set in Paris during the age of Soutine
and Chagall, and told in a language both eloquent and mad, like its tortured subject, the doomed painter
Modigliani. Reich’s prose charms and provokes—it smiles while being serious—and her arrival should
hearten those who value well-built writing that stands solid in a storm."

- Mike Heppner, author of The Egg Code and Pike’s Folly
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Martindale:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that reserve
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. These are reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Think about the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book if they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you will require this The Demon Room.

Edna Dixon:

Book is definitely written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
e-book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve The Demon Room will make you to be
smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think which
open or reading the book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they might be thought like that?
Have you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Jennifer Stephens:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, small story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping The Demon Room that
give your fun preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading habit all over the world
can be said as the opportunity for people to know world better then how they react in the direction of the
world. It can't be said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you who
wants to become success person. So , for every you who want to start reading as your good habit, you may
pick The Demon Room become your own personal starter.

Delois Dionisio:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. With the book The Demon Room we can get more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To be
creative person must choose to read a book. Only choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be
doubt to change your life by this book The Demon Room. You can more desirable than now.
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