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Targets beginning to intermediate Excel users seeking real--world examples of how they can use Excel's
powerful built--in functions Shows readers how to use Excel functions in formulas to help them decide
between buying and leasing a car, calculate mortgage costs, compute grades, evaluate investment
performance, figure college expenses, and more Gives explanations and examples of real--world situations
Provides an abbreviated discussion of an additional 200 functions Excel commands nearly 90 percent of the
market for spreadsheet applications; although this book is written for Excel 2003, the functions described are
in earlier versions as well
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From reader reviews:

Jamie Brewer:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be obligated someone or something
that they don't wish do that. You must know how great and important the book Excel Formulas and
Functions For Dummies (For Dummies (Computers)). All type of book are you able to see on many
resources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Brandon Li:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need more
time to be study. Excel Formulas and Functions For Dummies (For Dummies (Computers)) can be your
answer because it can be read by anyone who have those short extra time problems.

Rodney Bryant:

You may spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This Excel Formulas and Functions For
Dummies (For Dummies (Computers)) is simple to bring you can read it in the park your car, in the beach,
train and also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the e-
book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. And so there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Robert Mayo:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got college students? We believe that that
concern was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you
know that little person like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important and also book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by
book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is
niagra Excel Formulas and Functions For Dummies (For Dummies (Computers)).
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