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This complete, line-by-line translation of Much Ado About Nothing makes the language of Shakespeare's
play contemporary while preserving the metrical rhythm, complexity, and poetic qualities of the original.
The aim is to capture both sound and sense of Shakespeare's comedy without the need for glosses or notes--
to use contemporary language without simplifying or modernizing the play in any other way.

Features

Line-by-line verse translations, not prose paraphrases.●

Complete. No lines deleted or simplified.●

Accurate, authentic iambic pentameter.●

Looks and feels like Shakespeare's original.●

Tone, complexity, and poetic devices preserved.●

Subtlety and richness revealed without distracting notes and glosses.●

Attractive, easy-to-read layout.●

Ready for theatrical performance.●

Readers experience this comic exploration of male suspicion and its consequences with the challenge,
comprehension, and delight of audiences 400 years ago--the way Shakespeare intended.

"Too often, unless we read a Shakespeare play beforehand, we process the language as if it were coming
from a poorly tuned-in radio station. Shakespeare didn't write his plays to be experienced impressionistically
as 'poetry;' he assumed his language was readily comprehensible. At what point does a stage of a language
become so different from the modern one as to make translation necessary? Mr. Richmond is brave enough
to assert that, for Shakespeare, that time has come. The French have Moliere, the Russians have Chekhov--
and now, we can truly say that we have our Shakespeare."
--John McWhorter, Manhattan Institute
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From reader reviews:

Anna Elam:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or read a book called Much Ado About
Nothing: A Verse Translation (Enjoy Shakespeare)? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You understand
beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do
you agree with it has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Gregory Howard:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive
today, people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place
and notice through surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a
while is reading. That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to remain
than other is high. For yourself who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this specific Much
Ado About Nothing: A Verse Translation (Enjoy Shakespeare) book as nice and daily reading e-book. Why,
because this book is usually more than just a book.

Harry Greene:

You will get this Much Ado About Nothing: A Verse Translation (Enjoy Shakespeare) by look at the
bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for
your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by simply written or printed but in addition
can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking by your local
mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more
information about your guide. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still
upgrade. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Maria Carlin:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book has been rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people
likes reading, not only science book and also novel and Much Ado About Nothing: A Verse Translation
(Enjoy Shakespeare) as well as others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the
good a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or maybe
students especially. Those publications are helping them to add their knowledge. In some other case, beside
science guide, any other book likes Much Ado About Nothing: A Verse Translation (Enjoy Shakespeare) to
make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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