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Ten years ago, Sarah Susanka started a revolution in home design with a deceptively simple message: quality
should always come before quantity. Now, the book that celebrated that bold declaration is back in a special
anniversary edition. In this landmark home design book, America's superstar residential architect provides
homeowners the guidance and language to get what they want: a house that is better not bigger and one that
emphasizes comfort, beauty, and a high level of detail no matter how small it is. Featuring a new package
and introduction by Susanka as well as 16 additional pages that explore three new Not So Big Houses, this
10th anniversary edition is very big news.
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From reader reviews:

Carl White:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of various
ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to definitely
imagine the story how the character types do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this The Not So Big House: A Blueprint for the Way We Really Live, you are
able to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire
average, make them reading a guide.

Jake Harris:

The reason why? Because this The Not So Big House: A Blueprint for the Way We Really Live is an
unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap this but latter it will jolt you with the
secret it inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such awesome
way makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning
thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This
excellent book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book include such as help improving your talent
and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were being you I will
go to the guide store hurriedly.

Eli Benton:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside look likes. Maybe you answer may be The Not So Big House: A Blueprint for the Way We
Really Live why because the excellent cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not
disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense
will directly show you to pick up this book.

Eddie McCoy:

You may get this The Not So Big House: A Blueprint for the Way We Really Live by go to the bookstore or
Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for ones knowledge.
Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book through e-book.
In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most



important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for
you.
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