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What happened to a former Miss Egypt when she took to wearing the veil under her pilot’s cap? Who are the
young people posting videos of policemen torturing crime suspects? Where do Coptic Christians celebrate
the Holy Family’s journey to Egypt? Why is President Hosni Mubarak still ruling Egypt, virtually
uncontested, after more than 25 years in power?

In Hold on to Your Veil, Fatima!, author Sanna Negus answers these questions and more, taking the reader
on a journey into 21st-century Egypt. As a reporter, Ms. Negus witnessed Egypt’s political opening after the
Iraq war, the subsequent quelling of the Cairo Spring, and the growing influence of the Muslim Brotherhood.
In addition to politics, the author discusses the thorny issue of relations between the sexes, listens to Copts’
grievances about the worsening relations between Muslims and Christians, and reveals an appalling human
rights record. On the brighter side, she also visits oriental dancers and authors who defy censorship. While
Egyptians joke about the longevity of their president, there is no doubt that Egypt is a nation waiting for a
new, uncertain dawn. Hold on to Your Veil, Fatima! relies heavily on primary sources, on the words and
experiences of extraordinary Egyptian men and women, as well as the author’s personal encounters as a
Western woman. Intimate stories are woven together with historical narratives and news events. This is the
other side of Egypt, an intriguing modern nation a long way removed from the pyramids and temples visited
by most visitors to the country.

Watch the author's promotional video:
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Nebeker:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or the idea for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that concern above.
Every person has various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or
something that they don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Hold on
to Your Veil, Fatima!: And Other Snapshots of Life. All type of book could you see on many solutions. You
can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Rodolfo Rodgers:

Hold on to Your Veil, Fatima!: And Other Snapshots of Life can be one of your starter books that are good
idea. We recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that may increase your
knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The
article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into delight arrangement in writing Hold on to Your
Veil, Fatima!: And Other Snapshots of Life nevertheless doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the
hottest as well as based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be among it. This great information can
drawn you into completely new stage of crucial thinking.

John Jones:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Hold on to Your Veil, Fatima!:
And Other Snapshots of Life can be the reply, oh how comes? A book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these
publications have than the others?

Dana Richardson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know that
little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to something by book. Amount types of books
that can you take to be your object. One of them is Hold on to Your Veil, Fatima!: And Other Snapshots of
Life.
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