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The Catholic Church is the longest-enduring institution in the world. Beginning with the first Christians and
continuing in our present day, the Church has been planted in every nation on earth.

The Catholic Church claims Jesus Christ himself as her founder, and in spite of heresy from within and
hostility from without, she remains in the twenty-first century the steadfast guardian of belief in his life,
death, and resurrection. The teachings and redemptive works of Jesus as told in the Gospels are expressed by
the Church in a coherent and consistent body of doctrine, the likes of which cannot be found in any other
Christian body.

The history of the Catholic Church is long, complicated, and fascinating, and in this book it is expertly and
ably told by historian James Hitchcock. As in the parable of Christ about the weeds that were sown in a field
of wheat, evil and good have grown together in the Church from the start, as Hitchcock honestly records. He
brings before us the many characters--some noble, some notorious--who have left an indelible mark on the
Church, while never losing sight of the saints, who have given living testimony to the salvific power of
Christ in every age.

This ambitious work is comprehensive in its scope and in incisive in its understanding, a valuable addition to
any school or home library.

"The gap in knowledge of history and current events sadly extends to us Catholics in our grasp of the Faith
and the rich history of the Church. In his ambitious new work, History of the Catholic Church from the
Apostolic Age to the Third Millennium, James Hitchcock has given us an accessible tool to better our
understanding...and love for the history of the Church. To love the Church, we must understand her history.
As Blessed Pope John XXIII remarked, 'History is our best teacher.' Thank you, Dr. Hitchcock, for this
timeless gift to the Church for the Year of Faith."
- Cardinal Timothy Dolan, Archbishop of New York

"James Hitchcock is one of the few historians alive today with the background and ability to present the two-
millenium history of the Catholic Church. In this remarkable volume Hitchcock brings a lifetime of insights
and research to this important subject. It is a work of erudition in which the reader will discover not only the
importance of the Catholic Church in past centuries, but in our own time."
- Thomas F. Madden, Ph.D. Director of the Center for Medieval and Renaissance Studies, Saint Louis
University

"This book, by one of the premier American Catholic historians, is clearly addressed to a broad audience. It
is apologetic in the best sense, written from the point of view of a practicing Catholic, and addresses the
various questions that would occur to a lay reader inevitably influenced by views found in the larger culture.
The book is well written. It is not burdened down with details or many footnotes, but is attached to a strong
narrative line centering on meaning. It would therefore be appropriate to study groups."
- Glenn W. Olsen, emeritus Professor of History, University of Utah
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From reader reviews:

Robert Kuehner:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a reserve you will get new information mainly because book is one of many ways to share
the information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the figures do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to some others. When
you read this History of the Catholic Church: From the Apostolic Age to the Third Millennium, you are able
to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make
them reading a book.

Reginald Hunter:

The actual book History of the Catholic Church: From the Apostolic Age to the Third Millennium has a lot
associated with on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was published by the
very famous author. The writer makes some research just before write this book. This specific book very
easy to read you can get the point easily after perusing this book.

Sheryl Vaughan:

History of the Catholic Church: From the Apostolic Age to the Third Millennium can be one of your starter
books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary
that will increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to set every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing
History of the Catholic Church: From the Apostolic Age to the Third Millennium yet doesn't forget the main
point, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource info that maybe you can be considered one of
it. This great information can easily drawn you into fresh stage of crucial pondering.

Virginia Shrader:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will
make anyone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
much easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet,
newspaper, book, and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The book
that recommended for you is History of the Catholic Church: From the Apostolic Age to the Third
Millennium this e-book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This kind of book
was represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer require to explain it is easy to
understand. The actual writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this book
appropriate all of you.
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