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Mercy is a novel that explores the meaning of not only the word mercy, but love and loyalty, as well. The
novel begins with a man confessing to the mercy killing of his wife who was suffering a painful and slow
death to cancer. However, this man's story is second to that of the police chief, Cameron McDonald, who
finds the love of his life five years after marrying the woman in his life. Cam is a man to whom
responsibility is a suffocating burden he must bear. In rebellion against this weight, Cam breaks his loyalty to
his wife and explores a relationship with a woman who has the freedom he craves. It is not until his wife
learns of this affair that Cam finally realizes that he never really intended to leave his wife or the life they
have built together. Mercy is a story of the tests that challenge people every day and the mistakes that define
a life.

This study guide includes the following sections: Plot Summary, Chapter Summaries & Analysis,
Characters, Objects/Places, Themes, Style, Quotes, and Topics for Discussion.
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From reader reviews:

Carrie Porter:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As we know
that book is very important for all of us. The book Mercy by Jodi Picoult l Summary & Study Guide ended
up being making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is
rather advantages for you. The reserve Mercy by Jodi Picoult l Summary & Study Guide is not only giving
you more new information but also to get your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own
personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship together with the book Mercy by Jodi
Picoult l Summary & Study Guide. You never sense lose out for everything when you read some books.

Jeffrey Osburn:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now's
taking seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you
get the unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Mercy by Jodi Picoult l Summary & Study
Guide as your daily resource information.

Chris Boos:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the headline Mercy by
Jodi Picoult l Summary & Study Guide suitable to you? The particular book was written by famous writer in
this era. The book untitled Mercy by Jodi Picoult l Summary & Study Guideis the main one of several books
that will everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this
e-book you will enter the new age that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their idea in the simple
way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a wide
range of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world in this particular
book.

Desiree Grajeda:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-book
method, more simple and reachable. This specific Mercy by Jodi Picoult l Summary & Study Guide can give
you a lot of close friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have matter that they don't and
make an individual more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get
success. This e-book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more
than other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? We should have Mercy by Jodi Picoult l
Summary & Study Guide.
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