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Aileen's view on PMP Exam Preparation

To learn to ride a bike, a person must ride a bike. To learn to pass the PMP® Exam, a person must practice
with hundreds and hundreds of PMP® Exam Prep sample questions.

This book is the first book in our series of mini- books - PMP® Exam Preparation Simplified Series  Over
the last 16 years Aileen has helped over 10,000 project managers in her workshops obtain their PMP®
credential. Often the participants in Aileen's workshops are successful project managers who may lack
experience is specific topics on the PMP® Exam. The topics that participants seem to struggle with the most
are:

Earned value Management (EVM)●

Contract types and calculations(FPIF, CPIF, PTA, etc.)●

Network diagrams including float, free float, project float, leads and lags●

Financial based questions including IRR, ROI, etc.●

Statistical based questions●

There is one thing all of these areas have in common and it is math.

Aileen has decided to create mini-books in each of these areas so that students can gain both the knowledge
and the confidence to get these questions right.

Many project managers want to study just enough to pass the PMP® Exam and not one second more.
Aileen's view is to practice on enough sample questions in each area so that the project manager is confident
he/she will never get a question in that area wrong.

While the primary goal of this book and Aileen's workshops is to help you pass the PMP® Exam, Aileen
hopes that you will also walk away as a more knowledgeable and successful project manager.
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From reader reviews:

Josette Roscoe:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys that
aren't like that. This How to get every Earned Value question right on the PMP® Exam: 50+ PMP® Exam
Prep Sample Questions and Solutions on Earned Value Management (EVM) (PMP Exam Prep Simplified)
(Volume 1) book is readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the information here
are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want
to give to you. The writer of How to get every Earned Value question right on the PMP® Exam: 50+ PMP®
Exam Prep Sample Questions and Solutions on Earned Value Management (EVM) (PMP Exam Prep
Simplified) (Volume 1) content conveys thinking easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and
e-book are not different in the articles but it just different in the form of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking
How to get every Earned Value question right on the PMP® Exam: 50+ PMP® Exam Prep Sample
Questions and Solutions on Earned Value Management (EVM) (PMP Exam Prep Simplified) (Volume 1) is
not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Thomas Brim:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its protect may doesn't work
here is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer is usually How to get every Earned Value question right on the PMP®
Exam: 50+ PMP® Exam Prep Sample Questions and Solutions on Earned Value Management (EVM) (PMP
Exam Prep Simplified) (Volume 1) why because the excellent cover that make you consider with regards to
the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your
reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

James Ensor:

The book untitled How to get every Earned Value question right on the PMP® Exam: 50+ PMP® Exam
Prep Sample Questions and Solutions on Earned Value Management (EVM) (PMP Exam Prep Simplified)
(Volume 1) contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy means. The
language is very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was published
by famous author. The author will take you in the new age of literary works. You can read this book because
you can keep reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in addition to order it.
Have a nice go through.



Carmen Bell:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got scholars? We believe that that query
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book. Different categories of
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra How to get every Earned Value question
right on the PMP® Exam: 50+ PMP® Exam Prep Sample Questions and Solutions on Earned Value
Management (EVM) (PMP Exam Prep Simplified) (Volume 1).
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