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This encyclopedia, the first work of its kind, includes more than 800 alphabetically arranged entries on
subjects related to Lawrence and his works. Covered are such topics as Lawrence's knowledge of Islam, the
details of his military campaigns, his legacy in film and popular culture, his family members and
acquaintances, his biographers, and important book dealers, collectors, and scholars interested in his
writings. Most of the entries mention works for further reading, and the volume closes with a selected,
general bibliography.

Thomas Edward Lawrence (1888-1935), better known as Lawrence of Arabia, is one of the 20th century's
most legendary figures. As a British liaison officer during World War I, he led the Arab revolt against the
Turks. After the war, he helped change the political geography of the Middle East by advocating
independence for Iraq. Regardless of his substantial military and political accomplishments, Lawrence
aspired to be a man of letters. He recorded his Arab experiences in Seven Pillars of Wisdom, criticized the
Royal Air Force in The Mint, and prepared a translation of Homer's Odyssey. He also engaged in voluminous
correspondence with many of the leading figures of his day. This encyclopedia, the first work of its kind,
chronicles his fascinating and diverse career.

Included are over 800 alphabetically arranged entries on subjects related to Lawrence and his works. The
encyclopedia covers such topics as Lawrence's knowledge of Islam, the details of his military campaigns, his
legacy in film and popular culture, his family members and acquaintances, his biographers, and important
book dealers, collectors, and scholars interested in his writings. Since Lawrence's interests and experiences
were so varied, the encyclopedia discusses everything from the history and politics of the Middle East to
biblical archaeology, medieval castle-building, literature, and modern mechanical work. Most of the entries
mention works for further reading, and the volume closes with a selected, general bibliography.
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From reader reviews:

Dolly Taylor:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside
the book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of e-book
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want
experience happy read one together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the
Lawrence of Arabia: An Encyclopedia is kind of book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Aaron Covington:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more
time to be read. Lawrence of Arabia: An Encyclopedia can be your answer as it can be read by anyone who
have those short spare time problems.

Robert Rooks:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you
read a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Lawrence of Arabia: An Encyclopedia provide you with a new experience in reading a
book.

Amy Terrell:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this publication. This Lawrence of Arabia: An
Encyclopedia is simple to deliver you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train along with soon. If
you did not possess much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make
you much easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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