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Pamela, or Virtue Rewarded is an epistolary novel by Samuel Richardson. It tells the story of a beautiful 15-
year old maidservant named Pamela Andrews, whose country landowner master, Mr. B, makes unwanted
advances towards her after the death of his mother, whose maid Pamela had been since age 12. Mr. B is
infatuated with her, first by her looks and then her innocence and intelligence, but his high rank hinders him
from proposing marriage. He abducts her, locks her up in one of his estates, and attempts to seduce and rape
her. She rejects him continually, but starts to realise that she is falling in love with him. He intercepts her
letters to her parents; reading them, he becomes even more enamored by her innocence, intelligence, and
continuous escape attempts. Her virtue is eventually rewarded when he sincerely proposes an equitable
marriage to her. In the novel's second part, Pamela attempts to build a successful relationship with him and to
acclimatise to upper class society. The story, a best-seller of its time, was very widely read but criticised for
its perceived licentiousness.
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From reader reviews:

Jackson Ponce:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice simply by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yep, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than
other is high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Pamela book as starter
and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Louise Suttle:

This Pamela tend to be reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The explanation of this
Pamela can be one of several great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple reading
food but feed you with information that perhaps will shock your before knowledge. This book is actually
handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed
ones. Beside that this Pamela giving you an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you trial run
of critical thinking that could it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Brandy Felts:

You may spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This Pamela is simple to create you can read it
in the park, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically the
printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the book in your
smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Wanda Riddle:

A lot of book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by net on social media. You can
choose the most beneficial book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is
called of book Pamela. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it can add
your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about
reserve. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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