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Hit the road with journalist Mark DiIonno as he takes you on a tour of New Jersey’s extraordinary
Revolutionary War history. Listing more than 350 historic sites throughout the state, DiIonno has compiled
the most complete guide ever to the Revolutionary War in the Garden State.

New Jersey’s role in the Revolutionary War is widely overlooked. Every school kid learns about the Boston
Tea Party but not the Greenwich tea burning; and about the miserable winter at Valley Forge but not Jockey
Hollow. Schools fund class trips to Philadelphia’s Independence Hall but not Princeton’s Nassau Hall. To
find history in New Jersey, all you need is DiIonno’s book as your guide. His easy-to-read volume helps
readers explore the cities and the countryside from Bergen to Cape May County to find out exactly what
happened there during the Revolutionary War.

While previously published books center on the highlights — Fort Lee and Washington’s retreat across the
state, victories at Trenton and Princeton, the brutal winter encampment at Jockey Hollow and the Battle of
Monmouth —  DiIonno fills in the blanks. Battlefields, churches, homes of the famous and infamous,
cemeteries, parks, taverns, liberty poles, bridges, creeks, hills, museums, encampment sites, lighthouses,
historical societies, walking trails, monuments, plaques—if it played a part in or commemorates the
Revolutionary War in New Jersey, DiIonno tells you what happened there, the personalities involved, and
how to see it for yourself.

The sites are conveniently cataloged by county, with a helpful summary of the area’s war history beginning
each chapter. Each entry lists the town and directions to each site, and where appropriate, a complete
address, telephone numbers, and hours of operation. Both public and private sites are described, and DiIonno
advises readers of which private sites tours can be arranged.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Brackett:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled A Guide to New Jersey's Revolutionary War Trail: for
Families and History Buffs. Try to make book A Guide to New Jersey's Revolutionary War Trail: for
Families and History Buffs as your close friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you truly
feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The
book makes you more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let me make new
experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Noel Klein:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive at
this point, people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand up than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of A Guide to
New Jersey's Revolutionary War Trail: for Families and History Buffs book as basic and daily reading
reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Robert Polk:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book entitled A
Guide to New Jersey's Revolutionary War Trail: for Families and History Buffs your mind will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can be your
mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a reserve then become one type conclusion and
explanation that will maybe you never get before. The A Guide to New Jersey's Revolutionary War Trail: for
Families and History Buffs giving you one more experience more than blown away the mind but also giving
you useful info for your better life on this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern here is your
body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning an activity. Do you
want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

David Baker:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This A Guide to New Jersey's
Revolutionary War Trail: for Families and History Buffs can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you
know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new era is common not a
nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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