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Third Edition! With thousands of copies of Easy Microwave Desserts in a Mug now in print, dessert-lovers
around the world are enjoying these quick and delicious treats. This expanded edition, with 20 NEW
RECIPES, includes more than 100 single-serving mix recipes for desserts, breakfast treats and hot beverages
that are prepared, cooked and served in a mug in less than 5 minutes. In addition to former favorites like
Chocolate Brownie, Peach Cobbler, Pecan Pie, Blueberry-Lemon Coffee Cake, Cranberry Oat Scone and
Chai Tea Latte, you find scrumptious Italian Cream Cake, Almond Joy Brownies and Christmas Scones, plus
a simple recipe for vanilla sugar for adding vanilla flavor to the mixes. In both editions, the mixes that
require eggs, like cookies and cakes, are made using egg white powder, found on the baking aisle at grocery
stores, or meringue powder, found at discount stores or craft stores on the cake decorating aisle. Just add
butter or margarine and/or water to the mix, then microwave for about 2 minutes. Stir up a mix anytime you
want a treat, or make them ahead of time and store in plastic bags for later use. They're perfect for today's
on-the-go families, singles, seniors and college dorm students. They make fun cooking projects for kids and
unique, inexpensive gifts, like "Birthday Cake in a Mug". Visit www.BlueSagePress.com to try some of the
recipes.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Hinojosa:

The book Easy Microwave Desserts in a Mug: Third Edition make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You
may use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem with the subject. If you can make examining a book Easy Microwave Desserts
in a Mug: Third Edition to be your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your own capable,
increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open and
read a publication Easy Microwave Desserts in a Mug: Third Edition. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means
that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this guide?

Cesar Smith:

The book Easy Microwave Desserts in a Mug: Third Edition can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the good thing like a book Easy
Microwave Desserts in a Mug: Third Edition? Several of you have a different opinion about book. But one
aim that will book can give many details for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with
your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all
of these. Book Easy Microwave Desserts in a Mug: Third Edition has simple shape but the truth is know: it
has great and massive function for you. You can search the enormous world by open up and read a reserve.
So it is very wonderful.

Phyllis Greenfield:

What do you regarding book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
require something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being
bored faster. And you have time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They need to
answer that question due to the fact just their can do in which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar
on every person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on pre-school until university need this kind of Easy
Microwave Desserts in a Mug: Third Edition to read.

Lisa Vazquez:

Easy Microwave Desserts in a Mug: Third Edition can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Most
of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that may increase your
knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The
article writer giving his/her effort to set every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Easy Microwave
Desserts in a Mug: Third Edition but doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest in addition to
based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one among it. This great information could drawn you
into completely new stage of crucial considering.
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