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Robert Service completes his masterful trilogy on the founding figures of the Soviet Union in an eagerly
anticipated, authoritative biography of Leon Trotsky.

Trotsky is perhaps the most intriguing and, given his prominence, the most understudied of the Soviet
revolutionaries. Using new archival sources including family letters, party and military correspondence,
confidential speeches, and medical records, Service offers new insights into Trotsky. He discusses Trotsky’s
fractious relations with the leaders he was trying to bring into a unified party before 1914; his attempt to
disguise his political closeness to Stalin; and his role in the early 1920s as the progenitor of political and
cultural Stalinism. Trotsky evinced a surprisingly glacial and schematic approach to making revolution.
Service recounts Trotsky’s role in the botched German revolution of 1923; his willingness to subject Europe
to a Red Army invasion in the 1920s; and his assumption that peasants could easily be pushed onto collective
farms. Service also sheds light on Trotsky’s character and personality: his difficulties with his Jewish
background, the development of his oratorical skills and his preference for writing over politicking, his inept
handling of political factions and coldness toward associates, and his aversion to assuming personal power.

Although Trotsky’s followers clung to the stubborn view of him as a pure revolutionary and a powerful
intellect unjustly hounded into exile by Stalin, the reality is very different. This illuminating portrait of the
man and his legacy sets the record straight.
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From reader reviews:

Mildred Duncan:

The experience that you get from Trotsky: A Biography is a more deep you searching the information that
hide within the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to
know but Trotsky: A Biography giving you thrill feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in a
number of way that can be understood by anyone who read it because the author of this book is well-known
enough. This particular book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand
then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this
kind of Trotsky: A Biography instantly.

Gerri Townsend:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the subject Trotsky: A
Biography suitable to you? The actual book was written by renowned writer in this era. Often the book
untitled Trotsky: A Biographyis the main one of several books which everyone read now. That book was
inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new shape
that you ever know prior to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, and so all of people can easily
to be aware of the core of this publication. This book will give you a lots of information about this world
now. In order to see the represented of the world in this book.

Celina Ziolkowski:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specially book entitled
Trotsky: A Biography your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every
aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written
in a e-book then become one contact form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get before. The
Trotsky: A Biography giving you yet another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also
giving you useful data for your better life on this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern the
following is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a
game. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

June Ortiz:

As a student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to presently
there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as can't
see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we
know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Trotsky: A Biography can make you sense more interested to read.
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