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Offering readers an inebriating swig from the great cocktail shaker of the Roaring Twenties—the Jazz Age,
the age of Gatsby—Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells showcases unforgettable writers in search
of how to live well in a changing era. Vanity Fair editor Graydon Carter introduces these fabulous pieces
written between 1913 and 1936, when the magazine published a Murderers’ Row of the world’s leading
literary lights, including:

F. Scott Fitzgerald on what a magazine should be●

Clarence Darrow on equality●

e. e. cummings on Calvin Coolidge●

D. H. Lawrence on women●

Djuna Barnes on James Joyce●

John Maynard Keynes on the collapse in money value●

Dorothy Parker on a host of topics, from why she hates actresses to why she hasn’t married●
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Potter:

The book Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells: The Best of Early Vanity Fair can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a very important thing
like a book Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells: The Best of Early Vanity Fair? A few of you
have a different opinion about book. But one aim that book can give many data for us. It is absolutely
appropriate. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you could give
for each other; you may share all of these. Book Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells: The Best of
Early Vanity Fair has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can search
the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Crystal Parrish:

The event that you get from Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells: The Best of Early Vanity Fair
could be the more deep you excavating the information that hide in the words the more you get considering
reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and
Swells: The Best of Early Vanity Fair giving you thrill feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in
selected way that can be understood through anyone who read this because the author of this guide is well-
known enough. This kind of book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to
understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for
having that Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells: The Best of Early Vanity Fair instantly.

Caroline Hagemann:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of the books in the top
checklist in your reading list is definitely Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells: The Best of Early
Vanity Fair. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in getting precious
person. By looking right up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Willie McCall:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but novel and Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells:
The Best of Early Vanity Fair as well as others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how
the great a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or
maybe students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In other case,
beside science reserve, any other book likes Bohemians, Bootleggers, Flappers, and Swells: The Best of



Early Vanity Fair to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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