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Learn to create great-looking responsive web sites with Bootstrap
 
In just 24 lessons of one hour or less, Sams Teach Yourself Bootstrap in 24 Hours helps you use the free and
open source Bootstrap framework to quickly build websites that automatically reflect each user’s device and
experience, without complex hand crafting.
 
This book’s straightforward, step-by-step approach shows you how to install Bootstrap and quickly build
basic sites; extend them with styles, components, and JavaScript plug-ins, and even create sophisticated
designs with advanced features. In just a few hours, you’ll be using Bootstrap to bring responsive design to
virtually any site. Every lesson builds on what you’ve already learned, giving you a rock-solid foundation for
real-world success.

Step-by-step instructions carefully walk you through the most common Bootstrap development tasks●

Practical, hands-on examples show you how to apply what you learn●

Quizzes and exercises help you test your knowledge and stretch your skills●

Notes and tips point out shortcuts and solution●

Learn how to…

Download Bootstrap and integrate it into your project●

Quickly build your first Bootstrap site with the basic template●

Create beautiful and responsive site layouts with Bootstrap’s built-in grids●

Display more interesting text with labels, badges, panels, and wells●

Style tables and forms so they’re attractive, readable, and responsive●

Use images, media, and icons, including free Glyphicons●

Quickly create navigation and buttons, including dropdowns and search fields●

Add alignment, color, and visibility with Bootstrap’s CSS utilities●

Extend your site with alerts, image carousels, and other JavaScript plugins●

Rapidly create appealing functional prototypes●

Customize Bootstrap with CSS, Less, and Sass●

Lighten Bootstrap downloads by stripping out unnecessary features●

Build accessible sites●

Create complex designs that don’t look generic●

Who This Book is For

Those who already have an understanding of the basics of HTML and CSS●

Having an understanding of JavaScript will make this book a bit easier to absorb, but it is not required●

because the basics of JavaScript are covered
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From reader reviews:

Christina Bain:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book Bootstrap in 24 Hours, Sams Teach
Yourself will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know
about every little thing. But some of you think that open or reading the book make you bored. It's not make
you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or suitable book with you?

Lawrence Howe:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive improve then having chance to endure
than other is high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you that Bootstrap in 24 Hours,
Sams Teach Yourself book as beginner and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is usually more than
just a book.

Martha Skaggs:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know which one you should start with. This Bootstrap in 24 Hours, Sams
Teach Yourself is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves
what you want and need in this era.

Anna Humphrey:

Bootstrap in 24 Hours, Sams Teach Yourself can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Many
of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that can increase your
knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The copy
writer giving his/her effort to place every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Bootstrap in 24
Hours, Sams Teach Yourself however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest as well
as based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one among it. This great information could drawn you
into new stage of crucial considering.
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