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An essential work for rock fans and scholars, Before Elvis: The Prehistory of Rock ‘n’ Roll surveys the
origins of rock ’n’ roll from the minstrel era to the emergence of Bill Haley and Elvis Presley. Unlike other
histories of rock, Before Elvis offers a far broader and deeper analysis of the influences on rock music.
Dispelling common misconceptions, it examines rock’s origins in hokum songs and big-band boogies as well
as Delta blues, detailing the embrace by white artists of African-American styles long before rock ’n’ roll
appeared. This unique study ranges far and wide, highlighting not only the contributions of obscure but key
precursors like Hardrock Gunter and Sam Theard but also the influence of celebrity performers like Gene
Autry and Ella Fitzgerald.

Too often, rock historians treat the genesis of rock ’n’ roll as a bolt from the blue, an overnight revolution
provoked by the bland pop music that immediately preceded it and created through the white appropriation
of music till then played only by and for black audiences. In Before Elvis, Birnbaum daringly argues a more
complicated history of rock’s evolution from a heady mix of ragtime, boogie-woogie, swing, country music,
mainstream pop, and rhythm-and-blues—a melange that influenced one another along the way, from the
absorption of blues and boogies into jazz and pop to the integration of country and Caribbean music into
rhythm-and-blues.

Written in an easy style, Before Elvis presents a bold argument about rock’s origins and required reading for
fans and scholars of rock ’n’ roll history.
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From reader reviews:

Timothy Walker:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A book Before Elvis: The Prehistory of
Rock 'n' Roll will make you to always be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can
know about anything. But some of you think that open or reading a book make you bored. It is not make you
fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Donald Lombard:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Before Elvis: The Prehistory of Rock
'n' Roll. All type of book could you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet options or other
social media.

Elsie Wallace:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information today can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be consider if those
information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which one
works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource then you
understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will
not happen in you if you take Before Elvis: The Prehistory of Rock 'n' Roll as the daily resource information.

Kenneth Rogers:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book especially book entitled
Before Elvis: The Prehistory of Rock 'n' Roll your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering
in most aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every single
word written in a publication then become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you
never get before. The Before Elvis: The Prehistory of Rock 'n' Roll giving you a different experience more
than blown away your brain but also giving you useful info for your better life in this particular era. So now
let us teach you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will be pleased when you are
finished examining it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time
activity?
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