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In this analysis of the first colonialisms in history, the eastern roots of the Phoenician colonial system in the
first millennium BC are traced and the metropolis of Tyre is established as the final link in a long chain of
colonial experiences in the ancient Near East. The author reviews some of the theories and debates about
trade and the colonial phenomenon, scrutinises the colonial situations that arose in the East in a context of
long-distance interregional trade, and analyses the examples - Egypt, Byblos, Uruk, and Assur - where a
metropolis with a mercantile tradition intervenes and acts as intermediary in different interregional exchange
circuits. The success of a colonial metropolis is measured by its capacity to integrate dependent and
complementary economies in circumstances where there is a strong demand for raw materials by the great
powers. In that context, the profits obtained in the colonies thanks to price differentials between one region
and another bring us back to the unending debate about the place of the economy in the ancient world and
the pertinence of using features from modern economy - such as market, capital, private initiative, laws of
supply and demand, and money - to explain the economies of the past.
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From reader reviews:

Flora Young:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important for us. The book Commerce and Colonization in the Ancient Near East was making
you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what
advantages for you. The e-book Commerce and Colonization in the Ancient Near East is not only giving you
far more new information but also being your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your own
personal spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship with the book Commerce and Colonization
in the Ancient Near East. You never really feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Jonathan Head:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is from the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get
the unstable resource then you have it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Commerce and Colonization in the Ancient Near East
as the daily resource information.

Viola Coghlan:

This Commerce and Colonization in the Ancient Near East is great e-book for you because the content that is
certainly full of information for you who always deal with world and also have to make decision every
minute. That book reveal it details accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling
sentences included. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only gives
you straight forward sentences but tricky core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having
Commerce and Colonization in the Ancient Near East in your hand like keeping the world in your arm,
information in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen
second right but this reserve already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. stressful
do you still doubt that?

Mary Stockton:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen want book to know the update information of year to help year. As we know those textbooks have
many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. By the book
Commerce and Colonization in the Ancient Near East we can have more advantage. Don't one to be creative
people? For being creative person must want to read a book. Merely choose the best book that appropriate
with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life at this book Commerce and Colonization in the



Ancient Near East. You can more desirable than now.
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