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Notions, constructions, and performances of race continue to define the contemporary American experience,
including America's relationship to Shakespeare. In Passing Strange, Ayanna Thompson explores the myriad
ways U.S. culture draws on the works and the mythology of the Bard to redefine the boundaries of the color
line.

Drawing on an extensive--frequently unconventional--range of examples, Thompson examines the contact
zones between constructions of Shakespeare and constructions of race. Among the questions she addresses
are: Do Shakespeare's plays need to be edited, appropriated, updated, or rewritten to affirm racial equality
and retain relevance? Can discussions of Shakespeare's universalism tell us anything beneficial about race?
What advantages, if any, can a knowledge of Shakespeare provide to disadvantaged people of color,
including those in prison? Do the answers to these questions impact our understandings of authorship,
authority, and authenticity? In investigating this under-explored territory, Passing Strange examines a wide
variety of contemporary texts, including films, novels, theatrical productions, YouTube videos,
performances, and arts education programs.

Scholars, teachers, and performers will find a wealth of insights into the staging and performance of familiar
plays, but they will also encounter new ways of viewing Shakespeare and American racial identity, enriching
their understanding of each.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Johnson:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people
in the world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great along with important the book Passing Strange: Shakespeare, Race,
and Contemporary America. All type of book are you able to see on many methods. You can look for the
internet solutions or other social media.

Doris Stanford:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To
be sure that book is very important for us. The book Passing Strange: Shakespeare, Race, and Contemporary
America has been making you to know about other information and of course you can take more
information. It is rather advantages for you. The book Passing Strange: Shakespeare, Race, and
Contemporary America is not only giving you far more new information but also to be your friend when you
feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship
together with the book Passing Strange: Shakespeare, Race, and Contemporary America. You never truly
feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Bertha Morrison:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information presently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Passing Strange: Shakespeare, Race, and Contemporary
America as the daily resource information.

Anita Sizemore:

This book untitled Passing Strange: Shakespeare, Race, and Contemporary America to be one of several
books which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit
onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by means of
online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, because
you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from
your list.
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