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This wide-ranging and original book reappraises the role of genre, and genre theory, in British Romanticism.
Analyzing numerous examples from 1760 to 1830, David Duff examines the generic innovations and
experiments which propel the Romantic 'revolution in literature', but also the fascination with archaic forms
such as the ballad, sonnet, and romance, whose revival and transformation make Romanticism a 'retro'
movement as well as a revolutionary one. The tension between the drives to 'make it old' and to 'make it new'
generates one of the most dynamic phases in the history of literature, whose complications are played out in
the critical writing of the period as well as its creative literature.

Incorporating extensive research on classification systems and reception history as well as on literary forms
themselves, Romanticism and the Uses of Genre demonstrates how new ideas about the role and status of
genre influenced not only authors but also publishers, editors, reviewers, and readers. The focus is on poetry,
but a wider spectrum of genres is considered, a central theme being the relationship - hierarchical,
competitive, combinatory - between genres. Among the topics addressed are generic primitivism and
forgery; Enlightenment theory and the 'cognitive turn'; the impact of German transcendental aesthetics;
organic and anti-organic form; the role of genre in the French Revolution debate; the poetics of the fragment;
and the theory and practice of genre-mixing.

Unprecedented in its scope and detail, this important book establishes a new way of reading Romantic
literature which brings into focus for the first time its tangled relationship with genre.
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From reader reviews:

Dora Campfield:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book and so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a e-book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to imagine
the story how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people.
When you read this Romanticism and the Uses of Genre, you could tells your family, friends along with soon
about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a guide.

Rita Carter:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with
their family, or all their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, about to beach,
or picnic inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to
fill your own personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book could be option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the book untitled Romanticism and the Uses of Genre can be good book to read. May
be it might be best activity to you.

Violet Iverson:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to a person of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this one, reading
books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the particular book you have read is actually
Romanticism and the Uses of Genre.

Sebrina Knapp:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison
with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need
more time to be examine. Romanticism and the Uses of Genre can be your answer mainly because it can be
read by anyone who have those short spare time problems.
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